et "o S Te—(TT)04/0007/2003—16 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

The Gazette of Jndia

EXTRAORDINARY
a || —@vs 1
PART Il — Section 1
TR & TR
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T 6] ¢ feeett, YRR, SHad 1, 2016/ 11, 1937 ()
No. 6] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, JANUARY 1, 2016/ PAUSHA 11, 1937 (SAKA)

9 9§ = 7w <t St ® e 97 ot dehe & w9 H @ o e |
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legidative Department)

New Delhi, the 1st January, 2016/Pausha 11, 1937 (Saka)

The following Act of Parliament received the assent of the President on the
31st December, 2015, and is hereby published for general information:—

THE PAYMENT OF BONUS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2015
No. 6 oF 2016
[31st December, 2015)]
AnAct further to amend the Payment of BonusAct, 1965.
Be it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of Indiaasfollows—

1. (1) ThisAct may be called the Payment of Bonus (Amendment) Act, 2015. Short title
. . d
(2) 1t shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2014. ;?mmerm.nmt_
21 of 1965. 2. In section 2 of the Payment of Bonus Act, 1965 (hereinafter referred to as the  Amendment

principal Act), in clause (13), for thewords *‘ ten thousand rupees’ , thewords ‘‘ twenty-one ~ of section 2.
thousand rupees’ shall be substituted.

3. Insection 12 of the principal Act,— Amendment

f section 12.
(i) for the words *“ three thousand and five hundred rupees” at both the places o sechon

where they occur, the words ** seven thousand rupees or the minimum wage for the
scheduled employment, asfixed by the appropriate Government, whichever ishigher”
shall respectively be substituted;

(i) the following Explanation shall be inserted at the end, namely:—



2 THEGAZETTEOFINDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PART Il—Sec. 1]

‘Explanation.—For the purposes of this section, the expression
*“scheduled employment’” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in
clause (g) of section 2 of the Minimum WagesAct, 1948.".

Amendment of

4. In section 38 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1), thefollowing sub-section shall
section 38.

be substituted, namely:—

““(2) The Centra Government may, subject to the condition of previouspublication,

by natification in the Official Gazette, make rules to carry out the provisions of this
Act.”.

DR.G NARAYANARAJU,
Secretary to the Gowvt. of India.

11 of 1948.

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

GMGIPMRND—3984GI(S3)—02.01.2016.



IS Fo Elo TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

.’ ‘ 5
AR
I\ I
AL

HIXd = AU

Che Gazette of Iundia

EXTRAORDINARY
T [I—W@Ug 3—3U-Wug (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

YR | WehtioTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

G, 834] ¢ faeett, Wietar, fewew 6, 2016/3WEMUT 15, 1938
No. 834] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY DECEMBER 6, 2016/AGRAHAYANA 15, 1938

T ASFR AT
st
T2 feeet, 6 feawaw, 2016

&, 1115(3).—a=9 95 [a9, 1975 &7 T qarae Fd & o0, 99 959 (Fee)
g, 2016 F71 9TET S FET TR 999 HerT JfAf= Ty, 1965 (1965 FT 21) &t 41T 38 gTT Iacd
QTfEaT T ST FXd gU AT T TEATE FIAT &, IFA ATSTIH 6T 1T 38 FIT TAT AUTET AT TLHIT %
qH T TS HATAT 0l ATIG=AT |, ALALE, 915(3), g 26 fdaw, 2016 gRT AT & o9,
FETLTLO, 90 11, G 3, I7-8< (i) § ITh g0 TATT TATET af Al grer 39 aie § e IT&q
et & siafase 3o sferg=ET f afaar S #i1 Iuesy #vare w2 off, & fig fGm & samfar i
THTTCT & I3 AT AT AT ATHT FLA 5 ([T TR 017 T T

ST TSI STfREeT it wfat Serare i 27 fdaw, 2016 Fr 3uers Fars T8 off
T T T o Hee § e TR R RS ST 3i7 AT AT A gU S

A A, Freald TLHTL IFT ATTTAAT T &7 38 FTT T AT H1 TART Fed gu Feferiea
[EREEEIIEACRIGE

1. (1) = et =1 \ferey 918 e 9= (Fara) [, 2016 21
(2) T TSI § TRTA T ATLE il T 2|
2. 99" Harg a9, 1975, & {99 5, % I9-[9=H (1) #, T &1 AT 3w S|
[4. 912.16016/1/2014-S=w741]
1. . Agd, IT AErHeh

5604 GI/2016 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART ITI—SEC. 3(i)]

feoqur : g e WA F T, AT 1L @% 3, I9-ET () § AteeEdT e anar . 2367, anra
6 frdax, 1975 g varfoa fhu 10 o siie arar. A, d@ears 784(3), ari@ 10 ea<, 2014 gy sifaw
Terrer fohaT 73T |
MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th December, 2016

G.S.R. 1115(E).—Whereas a draft of the Payment of Bonus (Amendment) Rules, 2016, further to amend the
Payment of Bonus Rules, 1975, which the Central Government proposes to make in exercise of the powers conferred by
section 38 of the Payment of Bonus Act, 1965 (21 of 1965), was published, as required by sub-section (1) of the said
section 38, in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide notification of the Government
of India in the Ministry of Labour and Employment number G.S.R. 915(E), dated the 26™ September, 2016 inviting
objections and suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby, before the expiry of a period of thirty days from
the date on which copies of Official Gazette containing the said notification was made available to the public;

And whereas the copies of the said Gazette notification was made available to the public on the 27" September,
2016 .

And whereas no objections or suggestions have been received on the said draft rules by the Central Government.

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 38 of the said Act, the Central Government
hereby makes the following rules, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Payment of Bonus (Amendment) Rules, 2016.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Payment of Bonus Rules, 1975, in rule 5, in sub-rule (1), the proviso shall be omitted.
[No. Z. 16016/1/2014-WB]
Dr. D. CHAUDHURI, Dy. Director General

Note : The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide notification
number G.S.R. 2367, dated the 6th September, 1975 and lastly amended vide G.S.R. 784(E), dated the 10th November,
2014.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



I Ho Sto TeA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

MR 2
CThe Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
9 [[—EUE 3—3U-WUe (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

YRR | YehriyTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 573] T facelt, WWaR, WX 10, 2014 /<h1des 19, 1936
No. 573] EW DELHI, MONDAY, NOVEMBER 10, 2014/KARTIKA 19, 1936

T QAR AT
st

% fewett, 10 7awaT, 2014

qr. &1, . 784(3).—F=<1T TFL, TAE HeTT ATAHTT, 1965 (1965 FT 21) FT &7 38 F efi7
TﬁQﬁﬁﬁaﬁrW g0, A " FFH, 1975 7 7 "elred e & forg IERECEICIES
qAT —

1. HTErT AT 3T TS —(1) =9 FaHt &1 "ferm 99 a9 92 (FSenge) Fa9, 2014 8
(2) T TISIIT § THTAA T ATE I TG gl

2. Fre Terg e, 1975 (R =ad o Tama &°gr 17 8) ¥, s 5 % wom ww et R
T@T STTOATT, AT —

‘5. AT fFaveft - (1) ST HAn @adt a9 & ey | Tfatde &fefe & aw § g 3
gwwmﬁmﬂw%a@ﬁvwwaﬁm FT 1 FLALT & AIAT I9H [F ATUF

g Ig o arfie faaeoft stferfaem $ amr 19 # A g @wr  fiae s fi st
(2) s Rt Tt a9 & ey § AR Attt % ar § g=ar 3@ gu = 7 § vIE av 1 wad
T AT IHH & [HL & [ aTrih Eawoft T&qa He:
ateq 7g T Mg F g, e o, adiardt, W AT o7 SRS A TR R e

p-)

TEETT AR o, FATAT, AT T H ATGT 3% =9 § T 17 2|

TASTHRA : T8 ITAH o TAST 6 [T, “Toraei=dh o ATHSATH HT Agl o0 T ST T8 FAAT SIS0
srferfaaw, 2000 (2000 T 21) Fit &= 2 F @ (I) H g’

4445 GI/2014 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART ITI—SEC. 3(i)]

3. e =t ®, w7 % o, Feferfaa v staeatea B smoem serfae-
“TH o
[ 5(1) af&m]
Ufira arfi faaoft wrf

7. YT AT
(®  wETE A | |

TITYAT T IQqT HhTT SC&IT/FE T m T/ HeTT m

@ Fawrwmaw | |

fRATHT ®7 AT HET AT/ g l;l TeAT ol e/ ;

¢ T | ISk A o L S —

) Jag JYAT 1Y $ gda@or 97 fAg=or & forg suerft =afe 19
| |
QAT HHTT HAT/FAE HeT1 [ ] Tt wete g/ | |

t e —

ERCICIESN | oo [ dagaE, -
g. ﬁaﬁm%m(z)ﬁmaﬁﬁuﬁ%mﬁmﬁﬁ@w/mﬁ HEAT:
.. T TSR (a2 g (R wem)
(1) @ @ @

01 AT T AT FEEIT FEEE (TS TS 9dT 9|l BT
fafeera) sftafe=m, 1996

02 | et sy (R va seames) srfafaaw, 1970

03 | saeui~Ts JaTHT FHHT
(TSI U |4 erat &1 ) afaf=am, 1996

04 | swf=mdt wiaey fafer va vt swaer srfarfaar, 1952

05. | F=Tr e T srfarfaa, 1948.

06. | @ sfafaaw, 1952.

e @ AW, 1957 % faffaw 3 sruam A arq =@+
e, 1961  fafa=w 3 & srefie @i 1 Aifew

07. | srramT sfgf=a, 1948.




[aT I-&ve 3(i)]

AR bl TS« SHEROT

08.

He afiagd ST Afefaas, 1961.

09.

T Ta IfasE ata=as (77 srfafaa)

10.

TeEHT TG AT HIS BT

. 78T AT, SHaR U ST HAHT w1 RAg<or:

01.

FHATT T TATIAT o A0 | T Fa=wr 71 7197

02.

TATIAT o TTEFET g il arira

03.

FY % I TATIAT § (Ag<h Soharel it Fear

04.

Y % FF ST ATHH g1 FH1F 60 70 7 $i Fo qear

05.

Y % FF ST ATHH g1 13 0 70w 7| $i o qear

06.

Jae ATHRAT T ATH ( GTHI 6 ATHA H)

07.

Tar wEE de e E | e/t

SATamsdr [ | e | T | |

q. % qUE U T ¥ Q-

01. | 9 F = w1 Fhu U o=y & g

02. | @9 F A FwF R0 0 9w Ry fr g

03. | F F <f¥e e

04. | ATHTRS sra=rar & fa=
%. 94 F A faet e R aaifes safeat 6t e

.5, o HigaTy o (14 7 18 7 ¥ a7 ) EE} T

(14 T T 7 M7 F)
. Fa < (At AR):
IERIGE
= AT EEl et = TfRRemd ETIIAS

afT o=

FA

AF-FT

AHAA
g. (%) WAt &1 g

A ST FhAT ST e ETuiel AT 3T AT g A
BED AT THTT SRS THATH AAAT &A1 o FHTLOT Fe T[T o= e
(@) TR FTHA Ft dedT e ad & W 39 aiga st ea BT @

.5 FY o I FTERTT T HE&TT JAT TIZd FAAHT AT I397

o wifafds Asremst & dada sqaey FUf 7§ RAffie Feamor gRyumst w1 Rawon:

F.9.

ITASY FTS T2 (AT Fwearor giaest it T

ifafor (T s #9)




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART ITI—SEC. 3(i)]

. A TG ST ATHT AT FHATIIT T G&AT:

(1 (2) 3) (4) (5) (6) (1)
TATFET | e, a2 wrg O | T JreaT g =T FAT A9 FT HIT femaforr
H T T forr T 37 Ffaer AT | wFrar qft =i

Trfer T T AL ERIE IR IR Fi
Rk A s 7
FTO
Ty

# JATIOT F7dT § 3 Uk =T 97 ud "t § 947 & ag oft ywriorg wwar g B &9, 3 wraEr 9w any a9
FIGAT o6 AT ITAET FHT ATATAT 6T B

o | aE | | == T "

[®T. €. Se-16016/1/2014-sgai]
oY o, T, T4 AW T TSN qATE A

feoqeft : A F oA 9w 11, "R 3, IU-wve (i) ®§ g AW At AL @ 2367, i 6 fawEaw, 1975 F ger
JERTIOTT T30 0 o AT T 7.3, F&AT 251, R 7 S99, 1984 gy "enfera 3w 7w o

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 10th November, 2014

G.S.R. 784(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred under section 38 of the Payment of Bonus Act, 1965 (21
of 1965), the Central Government, hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Payment of Bonus Rules, 1975,
namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.--- (1) These rules may be called the Payment of Bonus (Amendment) Rules,
2014.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Payment of Bonus Rules, 1975 (hereinafter referred to as the principal rules), for rule 5, the following rule
shall be substituted, namely:—

‘5. Annual Returns. — (1)Every employer shall on or before the 1st day of February in each year upload annual
returns in the Form D on the web portal of the Ministry of Labour and Employment giving information as to the
particulars specified in respect of the preceding year:—

Provided that the annual returns shall be filed within the time limit specified in section 19 of the Act.

(2) Every employer on or before the 1st day of February in each year may file annual returns in the Form D to
the Inspector giving information as to the particulars specified in respect of the preceding year:

Provided that during inspection, the inspector shall require the production of the accounts, books, register and
other documents if the same are maintained in manual form or in electronic form, as the case may be.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-rule, the expression “electronic form” shall have the same meaning
as assigned to it in clause (r) of section 2 of the Information Technology Act, 2000 (21 of 2000).



[aT I-&ve 3(i)] R kT TSI : STHIYROT 5

3.

In the principal rules, for Form D, the following Form shall be substituted, namely.—
“Form D
[See rule 5(1)]
Unified Annual Return Form

A. General Part:

(a) Name of the establishment

address of the establishment. House No./Flat No. | | Street/Plot No.

[ ] PinCode |

(b) Name of the employer | |

address of the employer. House No./Flat No. | | Street/Plot No.

Town ;l District State Pin Code | |
E-mail ID| | Telephone Number [ ] Mobile Number I;J

(c) Name of the manager or person responsible for supervision and control of establishment
Address House No./Flat No. | | Street/Plot No.

District _ State |;I Pin Code |_ ]
EmailID| | TelephoneNumber |  |Mobile Number E

B. Employer’s Registration/ License number under the Acts mentioned in column (2) of the Table below:
S.No Name Registration If yes
1) ) 3) (Registration No.)
“)
0l. The Building and Other Construction Workers (Regulation of Employment
and Condition of Service) Act, 1996.
02. The Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970.
03. The Inter-State Migrant Workmen (Regulation of Employment and
Condition of Service) Act, 1979.
04. The Employees Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952.
05. The Employees’ State Insurance Act, 1948.
06. The Mines Act, 1952.
Notice of opening under Regulation 3 of the Coal Mines Regulation, 1957
or Regulation 3 of the Metalliferous Mines Regulations, 1961.
07. The Factories Act, 1948.
08. The Motor Transport Workers Act, 1961.
09. The Shops & Establishments Act (State Act).
10. Any other Law for the time being in force

C. Details of Principal Employer, Contractor and Contract Labour:

01.

Name of the principal employer in the case of a contractor’s establishment

02. | Date of commencement of the establishment
03. | Number of Contractors engaged in the establishment during the year.
04. | Total number of days worked by Contract Labour during the year

05.

Total number of man-days worked by Contract Labour during the year




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART ITI—SEC. 3(i)]

06. | Name of the Manager Agent (in case of mines)
07. | Address House No./Flat No. |;| Street/Plot No.

District | | State | | Pin Code
E-mail ID Telephone Number | |M0bile. No. I;
D. Working hours and week day:
0l1. Number of days worked during the year
02. Number of mandays worked during the year
03. Daily hours of work
04. Day of weekly holiday

E. Maximum number of persons employed in any day during the year:

SI. Males Females Adolescents (between the | Children Total

No. age of 14 to 18 years.) (below 14 years of age.)

F. Wage rates (Category Wise):

Category | Rates of No. of workers

Wages Regular Contract

male | female children | Adolescent male | female | children | Adolescent

Highly
Skilled

Skilled

Semi-
skilled

Un-
skilled

G. (a) Details of Payments:

Gross wages paid Deductions Net wages paid

In cash In kind Fines Deductions for damage or | Others In cash In kind
loss

(b) Number of workers who were granted leave with wages during the year:

Sl. No. During the year Number of workers Granted leave with wages




[aT I-&ve 3(i)]

AR bl TS« SHEROT

H. Details of various welfare amenities provided under the statutory schemes:

S1. No.

Nature of various welfare amenities provided

Statutory (specify the statute)

I. Number of employees benefited by bonus payments:

€9) (©) A @ &) () @)
Total Settlement, if Percentage of Total amount | Date on | Whether bonus | Remarks
amount any, reached bonus declared | of bonus which has been paid to
payable as actually paid | payment all the employees,
bonus made if not, reasons for
non-payment
DECLARATION

It is to certify that the above information is true and correct and also I certify that I have complied with the all
provisions of Labour Laws applicable to my establishment.

PLACE

Note

DATE

SIGN. HERE

[F.No.Z-16016/1/2014-WB]

P. P. MITRA, Principal Labour and Employment Adviser

: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide G.S.R.

No. 2367, dated the 6th September, 1975 and subsequently amended by S.O. No.251, dated the 7th January, 1984.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



21 of 1965.

The Gazette of Judia

Wik & e S
'PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Ul % St T (TN)04/0007/2003 07  <REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003— 07

W 55 o+ freeh, Teefrar, w13, 2007 / SRR 22, 1929
No. 55] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, DECEMBER 13, 2007 /AGRAHAYANA 22,1929

T T i e e 4 e & R e g e ee R w9 @ awe

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

£

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Leglslatlve Department)

12th December, 2007, and is hereby published for general information:—"

THE PAYMENT OF BONUS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2007
No 45 or 2007
[12thDecember 2007.)

AnAct further to amend the Payment of Bonus Act, 1965. -

Be it enacted by Parglament in the Fzﬁy eighth Year of the Republic of Indla as
ollows:—

1. () ThlS Act may be called the Payment of Bonus (Amendment) Act, 2007.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2006 _
2, In section 2 of the Payment of Bonus Act, 1965 (heremaﬁ:er referred to as the

rincipal Act), in clause (13), for the words “three thousand and five hundred rupees”, the
ords “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In section 12 of the principal Act; for the words “two thousand and five hundred
upees”, at both the places where they occur, the words “three thousand and ﬁve hundred
upees” shall respectively be substituted. ¢

4. In section 32 of the principal Act, clause (vi) shall be omitted.

—

i'ﬂ

b B 1

-New Delhi, the 13th December 2007/Agrahayana 22,1929 (Saka)

The following Act of Parliament recelved the assent of the President on the

Shert title and
commepcc—
ment.

Amendment of
section 2.

" Amendment -

of sectien 12.

Amendment
of section-32.



THL GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParTII—SEcC. 13

Repeat and 5. (/) The Payvment of Bonus { Amendment) Ordinance, 2007 is hereby repealed. Ord. 8 of 2007.
saving. '

{2) Notwithstanding such repeal of the Payment of Bonus (Amendment) Ordinance, Ord. 8 of 2007,
2007, anything done or any action taken under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have

been done or taken under the cotresponding provisions of this Act.
v

K.N.CHATURVEDI,
Secy. to the Govi. of India.

PRINTLED BY THE MANAGER, GOVT OF [INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI, 2007.

MGIPMRND—5354G{S-5)—14.12.2007



WPEd T Do Ter—()04/0007/2003—07 REGISTERED NO. DL——(NJ4/0007/2003—07 .

T
The Gazette of JIndia-

STHYRI
"EXTRAORDINARY
Y II— v 1
PART II— Section 1
wiER ¥ yeRE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

50 ¢ e, wfEm, seqan 27, 2007/0F 5, 1929
No. 50] NEW DELHL SATURDAY, OCTOBER 27, 2007/ KARTIKA 5,1929

WM A (e e @ S T fr g e AT A @I R

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compitation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, th;z 27th October, 2007/ Kartika 5, 1929 (Saka)

THE PAYMENT OF BONUS (AMENDMENT) ORD_INANCE, 2007
No. 8§ or 2007

Promulgated by the President in the Fifty-eighth Year of the Republic of India.
An Ordinance further to amend the Payment of Bonus Act, 1965.

Wms Parliament is not in session and the President is satisfied that circumstances
exist which render it necessary for her to take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 123 of the
Constitution, the President is pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance:—

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Payment of Bonus (Amendment) Ordinance. ~ Short title and
2007. commence-
- : : ment.

(2)\It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2006.

21 of 1965. 2. In section 2 of the Payment of Bonus Act, 1965 (hereinafter referred to as the  Amendment of
principal Act) in*clause (13), for the words “three thousand and five hundred rupees”, the  section 2,
words "ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [Pakt [I—Skc. 1]

Amendment 3. In section 12 of the principal Act, for the words "two thousand and five hundred

‘;g section rupees”, in both the places where they occur, the words "three thousand and five hundred
' ‘ rupees” shall be substituted.
Amendment 4. In section 32 of the principal Act, clause (vi) shall be omitted.
of section : S
32,
PRATIBHA DEVISINGH PATIL,

President.

K. N, CHATURVEDI,
Secy. 1o the Govt. of India.

PRINTED BY THE MANAGER, GOVT. OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI AND PUBLISHED BY THE
CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHIL, 2007

MGIPMRND—4237GI-—2%-10-2007.



	Bonus Amendment 01 01 2016
	Bonus Amendment 06 12 2016
	Bonus Amendment 10 11 2014
	Bonus Amendment 12 12 2007
	Bonus Amendment 27 10 2007



